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GENDER APARTHEID IN AFGHANISTAN 

 

Afghan women highlight the increase of women’s repression by Taliban rulers, which 
includes kidnapping, extra-judicial executions, forced confessions and the stripping of 
all human rights.  

 

On the third of May, SADF promoted an on-line conversation on Gender Apartheid in 
Afghanistan. It was animated by Hasina Jalal and Yalda Royan and moderated by 
Paulo Casaca, SADF executive director.  

In the course of the debate, Doctor Siegfried Wolf, director of research at SADF and 
Chris Blackburn, member of the Advisory Committee of the Global Friends of 
Afghanistan, made some questions and remarks.  

The participants highlighted the crescendo of repression on women and curtailing of 
their basic rights by the Taliban forces in Afghanistan, including freedom of movement, 
the right to free speech, the right of identity and even the right to earn a living.  

Western public opinion quickly stopped paying attention to the country. The various 
protests which erupted spontaneously in the beginning of the Taliban take-over were 
brutally silenced by an inhumane campaign of kidnappings, disappearances, murders, 
violations and forced confessions.  

It was particularly shocking that the reception of Afghan black-listed terrorists in Oslo 
was simultaneous with these developments.  

SADF calls on Western leaders to be coherent with their plights on human-rights and 
most in particular on basic women rights. We must fully support the Afghan women’s 
struggle to end the Gender Apartheid Regime’s atrocities in Afghanistan.  

 

Hasina Jalal strives to promote equality, human rights, and democracy in Afghanistan. 
She has worked in different capacities in both Afghanistan’s government and civil 
society. Hasina is the Founding Director of the National Association of Afghanistan 
Civil Society and has co-founded the first alliance of South Asian women on women's 
economic, social, and culture rights. She has served in the government of Afghanistan 
as a minister’s advisor and a director.  

She is currently a Ph.D. scholar in Public and International Affairs as well as a 
Research Associate at the University of Pittsburgh. Previously, she was a fellow in 
Georgetown University; she is also an alumnus of the Fulbright program. She has a 
master in women and gender studies and another master degree in business 
administration. Hasina is deeply concerned about the current situation in Afghanistan 
and is fighting for a return of human rights and democracy to Afghanistan.  

Yalda Royan is a senior development professional and women’s rights activist with 
extensive leadership experience in government as well as national and international 
NGOs. She has spearheaded women’s rights initiatives in Afghanistan through various 
USAID-funded projects wherein she sought to advance women’s political, economic 
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and social participation. When she was evacuated to the United States in August 2021, 
she was working as a consultant for the World Bank in its fight against Gender-based 
Violence issues in the public health sector. Currently she works at the office of 
Diversity, Equity and Inclusion at NOVA Community College and is also a Consultant 
to VOICE’s Afghanistan program. She has vast expertise in designing and leading 
gender initiatives relating to women’s empowerment, Gender-based Violence, conflict 
resolution, and peace and security. She also holds a master degree in gender and 
women studies from Kabul University. 
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